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Seminar paper from the year 2013 in the subject English Language and Literature Studies - Literature, grade:
1,0, University of Bonn (Anglistik), course: Gothic Fiction, language: English, abstract: 1. Introduction We
encounter the term Gothic in a lot of domains. In history, the term is to be found referring to the East
Germanic tribe called the Goths and in linguistics referring to their extinct language. It also relates to Gothic
architecture, prevalent in Western Europe in the 12th to 16th century and its revival from the mid-18th to
early 20th century, characterized by pointed arches, rib vaults, flying buttresses, large windows and elaborate
tracery. It is also used as a reference to the gloomy and horrifying Dark Ages. Today we have a subculture
which refers to oneself as Goths and their style as Gothic. In literature Horace Walpole's The Castle of
Otranto from 1764 is assigned as the origin of Gothic in literature. From this time on, Gothic features can be
found in many novels by different authors from continental Europe. It continued throughout different literary
periods, be it Romanticism or the Victorian Age, and its elements and figures were used in novels, drama,
poetry and short stories. Therefore, it is no wonder that its presence continued in the new media of the
twentieth century like radio, television and movies. There are movie adaptations of Gothic writings as well
as movies influenced by the Gothic and making use of its features. The cult movie The Rocky Horror Picture
Show offers grotesque characters: the straps and makeup wearing Dr. Frank N. Furter, a 'sweet transvestite',
his sun-tanned, flaxen-haired muscular creation Rocky, wearing golden underpants. A sinister and humped
servant called Riff Raff and all the strange-looking people doing the 'Time Warp'. This and an innocent
couple's strange adventure in an old and isolated mansion which is the home of the mysterious Dr. Frank N.
Furter, tempt the spectator to see a Gothic influence in thi
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From reader reviews:

Lynn Gowen:

In other case, little men and women like to read book The Gothic in the Movie "The Rocky Horror Picture
Show". You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. As long as we know about how is
important the book The Gothic in the Movie "The Rocky Horror Picture Show". You can add expertise and
of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can understand
everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple matter until
wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we can open a book as well as searching by internet gadget. It
is called e-book. You may use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's study.

Manuel Pina:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family, or their
friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic inside park.
They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill your
personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book may be option to fill your no cost time/ holiday. The first
thing you will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to test look for book,
may be the guide untitled The Gothic in the Movie "The Rocky Horror Picture Show" can be fine book to
read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Issac Molina:

Typically the book The Gothic in the Movie "The Rocky Horror Picture Show" has a lot of knowledge on it.
So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of help. The book was written by the very famous
author. The writer makes some research prior to write this book. This specific book very easy to read you
may get the point easily after reading this article book.

Keith Robertson:

This The Gothic in the Movie "The Rocky Horror Picture Show" is great book for you because the content
that is certainly full of information for you who have always deal with world and have to make decision
every minute. This specific book reveal it details accurately using great manage word or we can declare no
rambling sentences within it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it
only provides you with straight forward sentences but tough core information with lovely delivering
sentences. Having The Gothic in the Movie "The Rocky Horror Picture Show" in your hand like keeping the
world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no e-book that offer you world
throughout ten or fifteen moment right but this reserve already do that. So , this really is good reading book.
Hey Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt in which?
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