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A new luxury fever has America in its grip. Independent of stock prices, recessions, and inflation rates, the
past two decades have witnessed a spectacular and uninterrupted rise in luxury consumption. Ordinary,
functional goods are no longer acceptable. Our cars have gotten larger, heavier, and far more expensive.
Mansions larger than 30,000 square feet no longer seem extravagant. Wristwatches for the super-rich cost
tens of thousands of dollars. We are living in an era of excess.
Consider:

The average house built in the United States today is nearly twice as large as its counterpart from the1.
1950s.
Even as houses have gotten more expensive and farther from the workplace, there has been a sharp2.
increase in second-home ownership.
The average price of an automobile sold in the United States now exceeds $22,000, up more than 753.
percent from a decade ago.
Total U.S. spending on luxury goods increased 21 percent between 1995 and 1996 (typical of recent4.
years), while overall merchandise sales increased only 5 percent.

Robert Frank caused a national debate in 1995 when he and co-author Philip Cook described the poisonous
spread of "winner-take-all" markets. Now he takes a thought-provoking look at the flip side of spreading
inequality: as the super-rich set the pace, everyone else spends furiously in a competitive echo of
wastefulness. The costs are enormous: We spend more time at work, leaving less time for family and friends,
less time for exercise. Most of us have been forced to save less and spend and borrow much more. The
annual rate at which American families file for personal bankruptcy has grown to one in seventy. Budgetary
pressures have reduced our willingness to fund even essential public services: Our food and water are
increasingly contaminated. Potholes proliferate, and traffic delays double every ten years.
Frank offers the first comprehensive and accessible summary of scientific evidence that our spending choices
are not making us as happy and healthy as they could. Furthermore, he argues that human frailty is not at
fault. The good news is that we can do something about it. We can make it harder for the super-rich to
overspend, and capture our own competitive energy for the public good. Luxury Fever boldly offers a way to
curb the excess and restore the true value of money.
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From reader reviews:

Eric Chabot:

Within other case, little individuals like to read book Luxury Fever: Why Money Fails to Satisfy In An Era
of Excess. You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. Given that we know about how is
important a new book Luxury Fever: Why Money Fails to Satisfy In An Era of Excess. You can add
expertise and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, because from book you can
understand everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you may be known. About
simple point until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or even
searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel bored stiff to go to the
library. Let's study.

Helen Jackson:

The book Luxury Fever: Why Money Fails to Satisfy In An Era of Excess can give more knowledge and
information about everything you want. So why must we leave a good thing like a book Luxury Fever: Why
Money Fails to Satisfy In An Era of Excess? A few of you have a different opinion about e-book. But one
aim in which book can give many data for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer along with
your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you could give for each other; it is possible to share
all of these. Book Luxury Fever: Why Money Fails to Satisfy In An Era of Excess has simple shape but the
truth is know: it has great and big function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by wide open
and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Jesus Gates:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you may have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Luxury Fever: Why Money Fails to
Satisfy In An Era of Excess, you are able to enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still desire to miss
it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't have it, oh come on
its known as reading friends.

Lawrence Shults:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Luxury Fever: Why Money Fails to
Satisfy In An Era of Excess book written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book
that may be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written inside good manner for you, still dripping
wet every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still question Luxury Fever:
Why Money Fails to Satisfy In An Era of Excess as good book but not only by the cover but also through the
content. This is one e-book that can break don't evaluate book by its protect, so do you still needing yet



another sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already told you so why you
have to listening to yet another sixth sense.
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