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If you want to be a successful project manager, you need to become a person of influence. Without influence,
there can be no success as a project manager. And, although all key success criteria point to the importance
of developing soft skills as a project manager, few books exist about how to develop the power of influence
for achieving better project and business results.

Filling this need, The Influential Project Manager: Winning Over Team Members and Stakeholders
supplies detailed guidance on how to improve your influence skills to achieve better business results. It
explains how to set and meet ambitious goals for you, your team, and your stakeholders.

The book describes how to listen actively to influence others and details how you can build partnerships that
can pay dividends for a lifetime. Each chapter highlights real-world scenarios about a particular subject
linked to the influencing skill being covered. Each chapter also includes practical forms, templates, helpful
tips, and best practices to help you develop and refine your skills of influence.

Details the ten keys to influencing others to support you and your ideas●

Outlines techniques for improving your listening skills●

Includes a trust assessment for determining your level of influence and if others see you as trustworthy●

Demonstrates how to build a network of informal alliances to achieve success●

Supplying you with the vision of influence from an experienced project manager’s perspective, this book
will help you procure the informal power required to become a successful influencer. After reading the text
and performing the trust assessment, you will gain the understanding required to lead project members down
the path to project success.
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From reader reviews:

Steven Slaughter:

This The Influential Project Manager: Winning Over Team Members and Stakeholders (Best Practices and
Advances in Program Management Series) book is not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your
hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is definitely information inside this reserve incredible
fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get.
That The Influential Project Manager: Winning Over Team Members and Stakeholders (Best Practices and
Advances in Program Management Series) without we comprehend teach the one who reading through it
become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry The Influential Project Manager:
Winning Over Team Members and Stakeholders (Best Practices and Advances in Program Management
Series) can bring whenever you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' become full because you
can have it inside your lovely laptop even telephone. This The Influential Project Manager: Winning Over
Team Members and Stakeholders (Best Practices and Advances in Program Management Series) having very
good arrangement in word and layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Matthew Wallace:

Beside this specific The Influential Project Manager: Winning Over Team Members and Stakeholders (Best
Practices and Advances in Program Management Series) in your phone, it might give you a way to get nearer
to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh through the
oven so don't be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have The
Influential Project Manager: Winning Over Team Members and Stakeholders (Best Practices and Advances
in Program Management Series) because this book offers to you readable information. Do you occasionally
have book but you rarely get what it's about. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this in your
hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island. So do
you still want to miss the idea? Find this book and also read it from currently!

Laura Clark:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This particular book The Influential Project Manager: Winning Over
Team Members and Stakeholders (Best Practices and Advances in Program Management Series) was multi-
colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book The Influential Project Manager: Winning
Over Team Members and Stakeholders (Best Practices and Advances in Program Management Series) has
many kinds or type. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you
can read and think you are the character on there. So , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it
offers you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading in which.



Helen Widner:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from the book. Book is written or printed or illustrated from each source in which filled update
of news. In this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media
social including newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or
just searching for the The Influential Project Manager: Winning Over Team Members and Stakeholders
(Best Practices and Advances in Program Management Series) when you necessary it?
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