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This practical guide provides a complete introduction to developing network programs with Java. You’ll
learn how to use Java’s network class library to quickly and easily accomplish common networking tasks
such as writing multithreaded servers, encrypting communications, broadcasting to the local network, and
posting data to server-side programs.

Author Elliotte Rusty Harold provides complete working programs to illustrate the methods and classes he
describes. This thoroughly revised fourth edition covers REST, SPDY, asynchronous I/O, and many other
recent technologies.

Explore protocols that underlie the Internet, such as TCP/IP and UDP/IP●

Learn how Java’s core I/O API handles network input and output●

Discover how the InetAddress class helps Java programs interact with DNS●

Locate, identify, and download network resources with Java’s URI and URL classes●

Dive deep into the HTTP protocol, including REST, HTTP headers, and cookies●

Write servers and network clients, using Java’s low-level socket classes●

Manage many connections at the same time with the nonblocking I/O●
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From reader reviews:

Jose Anderson:

Reading a book to become new life style in this year; every people loves to read a book. When you learn a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, since
book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that you
have read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if you act
like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, along with soon. The
Java Network Programming provide you with new experience in examining a book.

Donovan Houseman:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book has been rare? Why so
many concern for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people
likes studying, not only science book but also novel and Java Network Programming or maybe others
sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel would like to read
more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those publications are
helping them to increase their knowledge. In different case, beside science reserve, any other book likes Java
Network Programming to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like here.

Dorothy Payne:

A lot of publication has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by web on social media. You
can choose the most beneficial book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever simply by searching
from it. It is identified as of book Java Network Programming. You can add your knowledge by it. Without
leaving behind the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most
crucial that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one spot to other place.

Eric Kinlaw:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got pupils? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. So you know that
little person including reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to understand that reading is
very important along with book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except
your current teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update about something by book. Different categories
of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is Java Network Programming.
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