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Techniques matter! Great ideas don't automatically translate into great programs. It's not enough simply to
show what is going on. The way you present your subject will influence how your audience responds. You
need to choose your picture and sound carefully, to convey your ideas in an interesting, persuasive way. This
book will show you how.

Video Production Handbook shows the full production process, from inception of idea to final distribution.
The book focuses especially on why each step occurs as it does and provides guidance in choosing the
simplest methods of creating the shots you want in your video project. Concentrating on the techniques and
concepts behind the latest equipment, this book demonstrates the fundamental principles needed to create
good video content on any kind of budget.

Suitable for students and beginning videographers, the new edition of this classic text retains its clarity and
directness but has been completely revised and updated.

This practical sourcebook has been specially prepared to give you an at-a-glance guide to quality video
program-making on a modest budget. Emphasis throughout is on excellence with economy; whether you are
working alone or with a small multi-camera group. The well-tried techniques detailed here will steer you
through the hazards of production, helping you to avoid those frustrating, time-wasting problems, and to
create an effective video program.

For many years Video Production Handbook has helped students and program-makers in a wide range of
organizations. Now in its thoroughly revised 4th edition, Video Production Handbook guides you step-by-
step, explaining how to develop your initial program ideas and build them into a successful working format.
It covers the techniques of persuasive camerawork, successful lighting and sound treatment, and video
editing. You will find straightforward up-to-the-minute guidance with your daily production problems, and a
wealth of practical tips based on the authors' personal experiences.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Patterson:

The particular book Video Production Handbook has a lot associated with on it. So when you check out this
book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was authored by the very famous author. The author makes
some research before write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can find the point easily after
scanning this book.

Arlene Wilson:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, small story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not seeking Video Production Handbook
that give your fun preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading routine all over the
world can be said as the way for people to know world far better then how they react when it comes to the
world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky person but for all of you who
wants to always be success person. So , for all you who want to start studying as your good habit, you are
able to pick Video Production Handbook become your current starter.

Antonio Nelson:

You can find this Video Production Handbook by go to the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it
might to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this book are various.
Not only simply by written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the
modern era just like now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what your problem.
Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to
arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.

James Bouchard:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library or to make
summary for some publication, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's spirit or real their
leisure activity. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally
there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and
can't see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you personally.
As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this Video Production Handbook can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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