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Lippincott CoursePoint is the only integrated digital curriculum solution for nursing education. CoursePoint
provides a completely integrated and adaptive experience, all geared to help students understand, retain, and
apply their course knowledge and be prepared for practice. CoursePoint is structured in the way that students
study, providing them the content exactly where and when they need it for a more effective learning
experience.  The powerful integration of adaptive learning, powered by prepU, with the premium digital
course content provides a personalized learning experience that drives students to immediate remediation in
their course content and allowing instructors and students assess their progress in real-time. The digital
textbook is downloadable, so students will have perpetual access to this content.
 
978-1-4698-5274-4   Hinkle  Lippincott CoursePoint for Brunner & Suddath's Medical-Surgical Nursing 13e
(includes integrated access to the ebook and adaptive learning, powered by prepU)

Readability, reliability, and robust resources combine in this outstanding nursing text and reference.
Designed to prepare nurses for medical-surgical nursing practice and for success on the NCLEX, Brunner &
Suddarth's Text of Medical-Surgical Nursing, 13th Edition, has been a favorite resource for students,
instructors, and practicing nurses for almost a half-century. Its comprehensive yet accessible approach covers
a broad range of medical conditions while focusing on the nursing process and the nurse’s role in caring for
and educating patients and families within today’s complex health care delivery system.   

This edition focuses on physiologic, pathophysiologic, and psychosocial concepts as they relate to nursing
care and integrates a variety of concepts from other disciplines such as nutrition, pharmacology, and
gerontology. Coverage of the health care needs of people with disabilities, nursing research findings, ethical
considerations, and evidence-based practice provides opportunities for readers to refine their clinical
decision-making skills. 

Fully updated and enhanced, this new edition provides a fully integrated solution that promotes clinical
judgment, performance, and success on the NCLEX examination and in nursing practice.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Ford:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing
for us to understand everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that
book has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They are reading
whatever they get because their hobby is reading a book. Consider the person who don't like reading a book?
Sometime, person feel need book when they found difficult problem or exercise. Well, probably you will
need this Lippincott CoursePoint for Brunner & Suddarth's Medical-Surgical Nursing.

Dustin Broach:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV,
or even playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity this is look different you can
read any book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the whole day
to reading a e-book. The book Lippincott CoursePoint for Brunner & Suddarth's Medical-Surgical Nursing it
is quite good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These people were enjoying
reading this book. In case you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy typically the e-
book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not too expensive
but this book has high quality.

Verna Riddle:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book specifically book
entitled Lippincott CoursePoint for Brunner & Suddarth's Medical-Surgical Nursing the mind will drift away
trough every dimension, wandering in each and every aspect that maybe unknown for but surely can be your
mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a book then become one contact form conclusion and
explanation that will maybe you never get just before. The Lippincott CoursePoint for Brunner & Suddarth's
Medical-Surgical Nursing giving you yet another experience more than blown away the mind but also giving
you useful details for your better life in this particular era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern
at this point is your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a
sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary spending spare time activity?

Shirley Eagle:

That publication can make you to feel relax. That book Lippincott CoursePoint for Brunner & Suddarth's
Medical-Surgical Nursing was colourful and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Lippincott
CoursePoint for Brunner & Suddarth's Medical-Surgical Nursing has many kinds or variety. Start from kids
until teenagers. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and believe you are the character on
there. Therefore , not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and



chill out. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading in which.
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