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In New York Times and USA Today bestselling author Kristen Proby’s brand new series, five best friends
open a hot new restaurant, but one of them gets much more than she bargained for when a sexy former rock
star walks through the doors—and into her heart.

Seduction is quickly becoming the hottest new restaurant in Portland, and Addison Wade is proud to claim
1/5 of the credit. She’s determined to make it a success and can’t think of a better way to bring in new
customers than live music. But when former rock star Jake Keller swaggers through the doors to apply for
the weekend gig, she knows she’s in trouble. Addie instantly recognizes him—his posters were plastered all
over her bedroom walls in high school—he’s all bad boy...exactly her type and exactly what she doesn’t
need.

Jake Keller walked away from the limelight five years ago and yearns to return to what’s always driven him:
the music. If he gets to work for a smart-mouthed, funny-as-hell bombshell, all the better. But talking Addie
into giving him the job is far easier than persuading her that he wants more than a romp in her bed. Just when
she begins to drop her walls, Jake’s past finally catches up with him.

Will Addie be torn apart once again or will Jake be able to convince her to drown out her doubts and listen to
her heart?
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From reader reviews:

Derrick Robertson:

This Listen To Me: A Fusion Novel book is not really ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your
hands. The benefit you get by reading this book will be information inside this publication incredible fresh,
you will get data which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. This specific
Listen To Me: A Fusion Novel without we recognize teach the one who reading it become critical in
contemplating and analyzing. Don't always be worry Listen To Me: A Fusion Novel can bring any time you
are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it inside your lovely
laptop even cell phone. This Listen To Me: A Fusion Novel having great arrangement in word as well as
layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Chad Steinberger:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon. You
can see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Typically the book that recommended to
you is Listen To Me: A Fusion Novel this guide consist a lot of the information from the condition of this
world now. This specific book was represented how does the world has grown up. The language styles that
writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some analysis when he makes this
book. Here is why this book acceptable all of you.

Brett Nash:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the most
effective book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is identified as of
book Listen To Me: A Fusion Novel. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the
printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most
essential that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one spot to other place.

John Coffin:

E-book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen need book to know the revise information of year to help year. As we know
those guides have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world.
Through the book Listen To Me: A Fusion Novel we can acquire more advantage. Don't you to be creative
people? To get creative person must like to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that suited with
your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life with this book Listen To Me: A Fusion Novel. You can more
inviting than now.
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