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Why do Jaws, Field of Dreams, The Big Lebowski, and The Godfather remain strikingly popular in this age
of fragmented audiences and ever-faster spin cycles? Hollywood Blockbusters argues that these films
continue to captivate audiences because they play upon underlying tensions and problems in American
culture, much like the myths that anthropologists study in non-Western contexts. In making this argument,
the authors employ and extend anthropological theories about ritual, kinship, gift giving, power,
egalitarianism, literacy, metalinguistics, stereotypes, and the mysteries of the Other. The results?original
insights into modern film classics, American culture, and anthropological theory?will appeal to students of
Film, Media, Anthropology, Sociology, and Cultural Studies.
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From reader reviews:

Stefanie Roach:

Book is actually written, printed, or created for everything. You can learn everything you want by a reserve.
Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important factor to bring us around the world. Close to that
you can your reading ability was fluently. A reserve Hollywood Blockbusters: The Anthropology of Popular
Movies will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about
everything. But some of you think in which open or reading a new book make you bored. It's not make you
fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or suited book with you?

Joan Cross:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they're still students or the item for all people in
the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that query above.
Every person has several personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be compelled someone or
something that they don't desire do that. You must know how great along with important the book
Hollywood Blockbusters: The Anthropology of Popular Movies. All type of book can you see on many
resources. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Billy Stinson:

The event that you get from Hollywood Blockbusters: The Anthropology of Popular Movies is the more
deep you searching the information that hide inside words the more you get interested in reading it. It does
not mean that this book is hard to be aware of but Hollywood Blockbusters: The Anthropology of Popular
Movies giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in selected way that
can be understood simply by anyone who read this because the author of this guide is well-known enough.
This book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go
to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having this particular Hollywood
Blockbusters: The Anthropology of Popular Movies instantly.

Wendy Cort:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got college students? We believe that that
question was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And
you know that little person just like reading or as reading become their hobby. You have to know that
reading is very important along with book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to provide you
knowledge, except your teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update concerning something by
book. Amount types of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them are these claims
Hollywood Blockbusters: The Anthropology of Popular Movies.
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