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Discover the origins of the warrior Clans in the conclusion to this thrilling prequel arc in Erin Hunter's #1
nationally bestselling Warriors series. The Dawn of the Clans takes readers back to the earliest days of the
Clans, when the cats first settled in the forest and began to forge the warrior code.

After moons of strife, the forest cats have settled into five camps. But now the dangerous rogue Slash has
kidnapped Clear Sky's mate, Star Flower, and made demands for prey that the cats cannot afford to meet.
Desperate to save Star Flower, Clear Sky must convince the other groups—led by Tall Shadow, Wind
Runner, Thunder, and River Ripple—to join forces. As Slash's attacks grow more vicious, one thing is clear:
if all five groups can't work together, their new way of life may not survive.

Dawn of the Clans #6: Path of Stars also includes an exclusive bonus poster and a sneak peek at the next
Warriors series!
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From reader reviews:

Linda Spaulding:

This Warriors: Dawn of the Clans #6: Path of Stars are usually reliable for you who want to become a
successful person, why. The reason of this Warriors: Dawn of the Clans #6: Path of Stars can be one of the
great books you must have is definitely giving you more than just simple studying food but feed a person
with information that possibly will shock your previous knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can
bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed people. Beside that this Warriors:
Dawn of the Clans #6: Path of Stars forcing you to have an enormous of experience including rich
vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day action. So , let's have
it and luxuriate in reading.

Christine Knox:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading
book and so. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a book you will get new information because book is one of many ways to share the
information or their idea. Second, examining a book will make a person more imaginative. When you
looking at a book especially hype book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how the
figures do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others. When you read this Warriors:
Dawn of the Clans #6: Path of Stars, you are able to tells your family, friends and also soon about yours
book. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a book.

Darren Reid:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't assess book by its handle may
doesn't work this is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the
outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer could be Warriors: Dawn of the Clans #6: Path of Stars why
because the fantastic cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint a person.
The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth sense will
directly direct you to pick up this book.

Mildred Shaw:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. That book Warriors: Dawn of the Clans #6: Path of Stars was
colourful and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Warriors: Dawn of the Clans #6: Path of
Stars has many kinds or style. Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Investigation company
Conan you can read and think that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are make you
bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like
reading in which.
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