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This book chronicles Loreen Niewenhuis's latest adventure: a second 1,000-mile walk, this time along
stretches of the shorelines of all five Great Lakes.

The book takes the reader on a ground-level walk through the beauty, the history, and the tender ecology of
Lakes Erie, Huron, Michigan, Superior, and Ontario.

A 1,000-Mile Great Lakes Walk also leads us on an exploration of self, as the author sets out on foot to
explore a region.

Like her 2011 book of a similarly-epic long trek around Lake Michigan, this new grand hike on the shores of
five magnificent bodies of freshwater explores the natural and human history of the Great Lakes, while
raising important questions about preserving our wild places and protecting fragile ecosystems on which we
all depend.

Loreen Niewenhuis is the author of short stories, essays, and the book that chronicled her long 2009 trek
around Lake Michigan, A 1,000-Mile Walk on the Beach. She lives in Battle Creek, Michigan.
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From reader reviews:

Paul Blecha:

Typically the book A 1,000-Mile Great Lakes Walk will bring you to the new experience of reading the
book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to learn, this book
very suitable to you. The book A 1,000-Mile Great Lakes Walk is much recommended to you to read. You
can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Linda Banks:

The actual book A 1,000-Mile Great Lakes Walk has a lot of information on it. So when you make sure to
read this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was compiled by the very famous author. The writer
makes some research before write this book. That book very easy to read you will get the point easily after
looking over this book.

Jessica Jackson:

This A 1,000-Mile Great Lakes Walk is great book for you because the content that is certainly full of
information for you who also always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This book
reveal it details accurately using great organize word or we can state no rambling sentences inside it. So if
you are read this hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward
sentences but hard core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having A 1,000-Mile Great Lakes
Walk in your hand like finding the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no
book that offer you world with ten or fifteen moment right but this e-book already do that. So , this is good
reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt that?

David Furtado:

That book can make you to feel relax. That book A 1,000-Mile Great Lakes Walk was multi-colored and of
course has pictures around. As we know that book A 1,000-Mile Great Lakes Walk has many kinds or
category. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and believe that
you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it makes you
feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading that.
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