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The New York Times Best Seller is now a major motion picture starring Lily James and Sam Riley,
with Matt Smith, Charles Dance, and Lena Headey. 

This movie tie-in edition features 16 pages of color stills from the film, a reading group discussion
guide, and other bonus materials.
 
“It is a truth universally acknowledged that a zombie in possession of brains must be in want of more
brains.” So begins Pride and Prejudice and Zombies, a bold reimagining of Jane Austen’s classic novel. As
our story opens, a mysterious plague has fallen upon the quiet English village of Meryton—and the dead are
returning to life. Feisty heroine Elizabeth Bennet is determined to wipe out the zombie menace, but she’s
soon distracted by the haughty and arrogant Mr. Darcy. What ensues is a delightful comedy of manners with
plenty of civilized sparring between the two young lovers—and even more violent sparring on the
bloodsoaked battlefield. Complete with romance, heartbreak, swordfights, cannibalism, and thousands of
rotting corpses, Pride and Prejudice and Zombies is an audacious retelling of English literature’s most
enduring novel.
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From reader reviews:

Clementine Frazier:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they're still students or the item for all people in
the world, what best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't wish do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Pride and Prejudice and
Zombies. All type of book could you see on many options. You can look for the internet options or other
social media.

Thomas Tritt:

The publication with title Pride and Prejudice and Zombies has lot of information that you can study it. You
can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This book exist new understanding the information that exist
in this e-book represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to know how the
improvement of the world. This book will bring you in new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book
on the smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Russell Stringer:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the spare time or they will get
lots of stress from both daily life and work. So , if we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely of
course. People is human not just a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are there when the
spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading textbooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, often the book you have read is
definitely Pride and Prejudice and Zombies.

Ann Lang:

This Pride and Prejudice and Zombies is brand-new way for you who has curiosity to look for some
information as it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you
know or you who still having little digest in reading this Pride and Prejudice and Zombies can be the light
food for yourself because the information inside that book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books
produce itself in the form which can be reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book form. People who
think that in book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this book is the answer. So there is no in reading a
book especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for an individual. So , don't
miss the item! Just read this e-book sort for your better life in addition to knowledge.
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