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 The Essential Cosmic Perspective, Seventh Edition gives non-science majors a streamlined, cutting edge
introduction to astronomy built on a strong tradition of effective pedagogy and coverage. Focus on skill
building includes new group work exercises that require active participation, helping you to retain concepts
longer and build communication skills. MasteringAstronomy® works with the text to create a learning
program that enables you to learn interactively both in and out of the classroom.

This text is a brief version of the authors’ The Cosmic Perspective   Plus MasteringAstronomy.

This program will provide a better learning experience for you. Here’s how:

Personalize learning with MasteringAstronomy: MasteringAstronomy provides you with engaging and
interactive experiences that coach you through introductory astronomy with specific wrong-answer feedback,
hints, and a wide variety of educationally effective content.
Gain a modern understanding of astronomy with the latest content: Since the previous edition, new
discoveries about Exoplanets, planetary formation, dark matter, and the early universe have had a significant
impact on our understanding of astronomy. The Seventh Edition incorporates this new content to give you a
modern presentation of the science.
Learn effectively: Better understand astronomy with a clear and continually reinforced learning path from
chapter opening to end of chapter using dynamic learning tools in the text and in MasteringAstronomy.
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From reader reviews:

Ernest Pettaway:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they're still students or the item for all people in
the world, what best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't
wish do that. You must know how great and important the book Essential Cosmic Perspective, The, Books a
la Carte Plus MasteringAstronomy with eText -- Access Card Package (7th Edition). All type of book is it
possible to see on many resources. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Amanda Bell:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man? If you
don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have free
time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They have to answer that question
because just their can do which. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is right.
Because start from on guardería until university need this Essential Cosmic Perspective, The, Books a la
Carte Plus MasteringAstronomy with eText -- Access Card Package (7th Edition) to read.

David Peacock:

Within this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more valuable
than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you
must do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. Among the
books in the top list in your reading list is Essential Cosmic Perspective, The, Books a la Carte Plus
MasteringAstronomy with eText -- Access Card Package (7th Edition). This book which can be qualified as
The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking way up and review this book
you can get many advantages.

Julio Huntsman:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is written or printed or descriptive from each source in which filled update of
news. In this particular modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for an
individual. From media social such as newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book,
novel and comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to
spread out your book? Or just trying to find the Essential Cosmic Perspective, The, Books a la Carte Plus
MasteringAstronomy with eText -- Access Card Package (7th Edition) when you required it?
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