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The powerful account of one writer's unlikely friendship with his childhood bully, now the president of
a motorcycle club in one of America's most dangerous cities.

Once upon a time, Alex Abramovich and Trevor Latham were mortal enemies: miniature outlaws in a Long
Island elementary school, perpetually at each other's throats. Then they lost track of each other. Decades
later, when they met again, Abramovich was a writer and Latham had become President of the East Bay
Rats, a motorcycle club in Oakland.

In 2010, Abramovich moved to California to immerse himself in Latham's world - one of fight clubs, booze-
filled nights, and beat-downs on the city's streets. But dangerous, dysfunctional Oakland was also becoming
one of America's most rapidly gentrifying cities, and the questions Abramovich had arrived with were
thrown into brutal relief: How do we live with the burden of violence? How do we overcome it? Do we
overcome it?

As Trevor, the Rats, and the city they live in careen between crises and moments of renaissance, Abramovich
explores issues of friendship, family, history, and destiny - and looks at what happens when those things fail.
Bullies is at once a vivid, visceral narrative of an unusual friendship and an incisive portrait of a beautiful,
terrible city.
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From reader reviews:

Monte Lawson:

In other case, little men and women like to read book Bullies: A Friendship. You can choose the best book if
you'd prefer reading a book. So long as we know about how is important some sort of book Bullies: A
Friendship. You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right,
since from book you can realize everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you may
be known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we can open a
book or perhaps searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored to go
to the library. Let's study.

Marisa Reber:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading practice give you
lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book this
improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of book you read, if
you want attract knowledge just go with training books but if you want sense happy read one together with
theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The Bullies: A Friendship is kind of guide which is
giving the reader unstable experience.

Lillian Robbins:

This Bullies: A Friendship are generally reliable for you who want to be considered a successful person,
why. The explanation of this Bullies: A Friendship can be one of many great books you must have is
definitely giving you more than just simple reading food but feed you actually with information that
probably will shock your preceding knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it everywhere and
whenever your conditions in e-book and printed people. Beside that this Bullies: A Friendship giving you an
enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we all know it useful
in your day pastime. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Sandra Passmore:

Is it you who having spare time and then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or just
lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Bullies: A Friendship can be the solution, oh
how comes? A book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your time by reading in this brand new
era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides have than the others?
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