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Addicted to You follows the sexy bachelor and notorious bad boy Tanner Hayes as he meets a mysterious
woman named Gia. While their passionate meeting seems to end as a fling on a plane, their chance crossing
is anything but over.

Tanner soon discovers that Gia is the cousin of his brother’s lover, Riley and Gia works for his brother as an
intern. That does nothing to stop Tanner from growing more and more obsessed with Gia because of the
explosive mind games she plays with his head.

Tanner might have finally met his match when it comes to the daring Gia!

However, as time marches on, Tanner and Gia find themselves growing closer and closer until something so
big happens, it will test their relationship and life as they know it!

I.M. Hicks has penned yet another steamy romance with more twists and turns than even Tanner and Gia
could see coming. Addicted to You is part two of the steamy Players Series.
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From reader reviews:

Bernard Woodley:

This book untitled Addicted to you: Players (Players Series Book 2) to be one of several books that will best
seller in this year, that's because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will
easily to buy this particular book in the book retail outlet or you can order it by way of online. The publisher
with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, since you can read this book in
your Mobile phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this guide from your list.

Helen Thibodeaux:

The book with title Addicted to you: Players (Players Series Book 2) includes a lot of information that you
can discover it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This specific book exist new understanding the
information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world right now. That is important
to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you in new era of the the
positive effect. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Patrick Taylor:

The book untitled Addicted to you: Players (Players Series Book 2) contain a lot of information on the item.
The writer explains your ex idea with easy approach. The language is very easy to understand all the people,
so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was authored by famous author. The
author will take you in the new era of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can read on
your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish
to purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice read.

Kayla France:

Many people said that they feel weary when they reading a guide. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the particular book Addicted to you: Players (Players Series
Book 2) to make your own reading is interesting. Your skill of reading expertise is developing when you
similar to reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the impression
about book and reading through especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to wide open a book
and examine it. Beside that the book Addicted to you: Players (Players Series Book 2) can to be your new
friend when you're experience alone and confuse with what must you're doing of that time.

Download and Read Online Addicted to you: Players (Players Series



Book 2) I.M. Hicks #DSJAV4PEF7H



Read Addicted to you: Players (Players Series Book 2) by I.M. Hicks
for online ebook

Addicted to you: Players (Players Series Book 2) by I.M. Hicks Free PDF d0wnl0ad, audio books, books to
read, good books to read, cheap books, good books, online books, books online, book reviews epub, read
books online, books to read online, online library, greatbooks to read, PDF best books to read, top books to
read Addicted to you: Players (Players Series Book 2) by I.M. Hicks books to read online.

Online Addicted to you: Players (Players Series Book 2) by I.M. Hicks ebook PDF
download

Addicted to you: Players (Players Series Book 2) by I.M. Hicks Doc

Addicted to you: Players (Players Series Book 2) by I.M. Hicks Mobipocket

Addicted to you: Players (Players Series Book 2) by I.M. Hicks EPub


