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"Superbly crafted and astonishingly powerful. . . . It will thrill readers who cherish their worn copies of To
Kill A Mockingbird." --People

With a suspense, lyricism, and moral complexity that recall To Kill a Mockingbird and Presumed
Innocent, this compulsively readable novel explores what happens when a woman who has devoted herself
to ushering life into the world finds herself charged with responsibility in a patient's tragic death.

The time is 1981, and Sibyl Danforth has been a dedicated midwife in the rural community of Reddington,
Vermont, for fifteen years. But one treacherous winter night, in a house isolated by icy roads and failed
telephone lines, Sibyl takes desperate measures to save a baby's life. She performs an emergency Caesarean
section on its mother, who appears to have died in labor. But what if--as Sibyl's assistant later charges--the
patient wasn't already dead, and it was Sibyl who inadvertently killed her?

As recounted by Sibyl's precocious fourteen-year-old daughter, Connie, the ensuing trial bears the earmarks
of a witch hunt except for the fact that all its participants are acting from the highest motives--and the
defendant increasingly appears to be guilty. As Sibyl Danforth faces the antagonism of the law, the hostility
of traditional doctors, and the accusations of her own conscience, Midwives engages, moves, and transfixes
us as only the very best novels ever do.

BONUS: This edition includes an excerpt from Chris Bohjalian's The Light in the Ruins.
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From reader reviews:

Bessie Hall:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family,
or all their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic
inside park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different
to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book may be option to fill your cost-free time/
holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to
consider look for book, may be the e-book untitled Midwives: A Novel (Vintage Contemporaries) can be
fine book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Doris Snell:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information much easier to
share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon. You
will observe that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to your account is Midwives: A Novel (Vintage Contemporaries) this publication consist a lot
of the information of the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented so why is the world
has grown up. The dialect styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made
some investigation when he makes this book. This is why this book ideal all of you.

Shirley Hinkle:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by online on social media. You can
choose the very best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is called of
book Midwives: A Novel (Vintage Contemporaries). You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without
causing the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most essential that,
you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one place to other place.

Haydee Todd:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got students? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And also you
know that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to know that reading is
very important and also book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update about something by book. Different categories of
books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is actually Midwives: A Novel (Vintage
Contemporaries).
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