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• The guides will be contained in a unique, high quality box that is The Legend of Zelda™ themed and held
closed by an embedded magnetic clasp.

• An individually numbered certificate of authenticity will be included for collectors, with a signature and
message from Mr. Eiji Aonuma, Producer/Director for The Legend of Zelda™ series. 

• A high quality, 2-sided laser etched metallic bookmark will be included with the box set to help players
keep their spot in over 2,000 pages of The Legend of Zelda™ strategies. The bookmark is 7.5 x 2.5 inches
and includes a protective case.

• The set includes 6 hardcover collector’s editions for The Legend of Zelda™: Ocarina of Time 3D, The
Legend of Zelda™: Spirit Tracks, The Legend of Zelda™: Phantom Hourglass, The Legend of Zelda™: The
Wind Waker HD, The Legend of Zelda™: Twilight Princess, and The Legend of Zelda™: Skyward Sword.
Many of these hard cover guides are out of print and not available anywhere else. 

• All 6 of the guides will be on high quality paper with gilded edges, giving the guides a gold shine along the
pages.

• For the first time ever, The Legend of Zelda™: Ocarina of Time 3D guide is available in hard cover and
exclusive to this box set. 

• The Legend of Zelda™: Skyward Sword guide has been revised and expanded by over 100 pages. 

• This limited edition set will only be printed once, when it is sold out they will be gone forever!
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From reader reviews:

Susan Padgett:

This The Legend of Zelda Boxed Set: Prima Official Game Guide book is not ordinary book, you have it
then the world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is actually information inside this
reserve incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will
get. That The Legend of Zelda Boxed Set: Prima Official Game Guide without we recognize teach the one
who reading it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't be worry The Legend of Zelda Boxed
Set: Prima Official Game Guide can bring if you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' come to
be full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even cell phone. This The Legend of Zelda Boxed Set:
Prima Official Game Guide having fine arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not truly feel
uninterested in reading.

Elliott Townsend:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the concept The Legend of
Zelda Boxed Set: Prima Official Game Guide suitable to you? The actual book was written by famous writer
in this era. The actual book untitled The Legend of Zelda Boxed Set: Prima Official Game Guideis the main
of several books which everyone read now. That book was inspired many men and women in the world.
When you read this reserve you will enter the new dimension that you ever know before. The author
explained their strategy in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to understand the core of this e-
book. This book will give you a great deal of information about this world now. So that you can see the
represented of the world with this book.

Dennis Winters:

The book untitled The Legend of Zelda Boxed Set: Prima Official Game Guide contain a lot of information
on that. The writer explains the woman idea with easy means. The language is very simple to implement all
the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was compiled by famous author. The author
brings you in the new period of time of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can read
on your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy
the e-book, you can open up their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice study.

Doris Garcia:

This The Legend of Zelda Boxed Set: Prima Official Game Guide is brand new way for you who has intense
curiosity to look for some information as it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you in it getting
knowledge more you know or you who still having little bit of digest in reading this The Legend of Zelda
Boxed Set: Prima Official Game Guide can be the light food to suit your needs because the information
inside this specific book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books create itself in the form that is
certainly reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in book



form make them feel tired even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a reserve
especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for an individual. So , don't miss
the idea! Just read this e-book kind for your better life along with knowledge.
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