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Key Features

Learn to work with the key aspects of Yii Framework 2●

Explore how to create RESTful APIs with Yii●

Incorporate codeception with Yii2 to test your code thoroughly●

Book Description

The successor of Yii Framework 1.1, Yii2 is a complete rewrite of Yii Framework, one of the most popular
PHP 5 frameworks for making modern web applications. The update embraces the best practices and
protocols established with newer versions of PHP, while still maintaining the simple, fast, and extendable
behavior found in its predecessor.

This book has been written to enhance your skills and knowledge with Yii Framework 2. Starting with
configuration and how to initialize new projects, you'll learn how to configure, manage, and use every aspect
of Yii2 from Gii, DAO, Query Builder, Active Record, and migrations, to asset manager. You'll also
discover how to automatically test your code using codeception.

With this book by your side, you'll have all the skills you need to quickly create rich modern web and
console applications with Yii2.

What you will learn

Explore Yii2's conventions and learn how to properly configure Yii2●

Create both web and console applications●

Reduce development time by learning to create classes automatically with Gii, Yii2's automatic code●

generation tool
Use Yii2's database migration tool●

Manage and access databases with Active Record, DAO, and Query Builder●

Handle user authentication and authorization within Yii2●

Create RESTful APIs with Yii Framework 2●

Test applications automatically with codeception●

About the Author

Charles R. Portwood II has over 10 years of experience developing modern web applications and is well
versed in integrating PHP with native mobile applications. An avid proponent of Yii Framework and open
source software, Charles has contributed multiple guides, extensions, and applications to the Yii community.
In addition to being a programmer, he is also a Linux system administrator.
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From reader reviews:

Anna Raynor:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new details.
When you read a guide you will get new information mainly because book is one of several ways to share
the information or perhaps their idea. Second, examining a book will make you actually more imaginative.
When you studying a book especially fiction book the author will bring someone to imagine the story how
the character types do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this
Mastering Yii, you may tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours publication. Your
knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a reserve.

Christopher Gaul:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them household or
their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, as well as
playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that's look different you can
read some sort of book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book which you read you can
spent 24 hours a day to reading a guide. The book Mastering Yii it is rather good to read. There are a lot of
individuals who recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have
enough space to create this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this
book out of your smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book offers high quality.

Raymond Langford:

The book untitled Mastering Yii contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains her idea with easy
method. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to
read it. The book was authored by famous author. The author will bring you in the new time of literary
works. It is possible to read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or model, so you can
read the book with anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can available their official
web-site and also order it. Have a nice go through.

Cynthia Barksdale:

With this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability to do something more are more treasured
than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you should do is
just spending your time not much but quite enough to have a look at some books. On the list of books in the
top checklist in your reading list is usually Mastering Yii. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes
can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking up and review this reserve you can get
many advantages.
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