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All three of the Men of the Sisterhood novellas together for the first time!

For the first time the menfolk are stepping out of the pages of #1 New York Times  bestselling author Fern
Michaels’ beloved Sisterhood series and into the spotlight…

After years of standing by their women, the Sisterhood’s significant others have also become loyal friends.
And now Jack Emery, Nikki’s husband, has enlisted Ted, Joe, Jay, Bert, Dennis, and Abner to form a top-
secret organization known as BOLO Consultants.

Jack has two missions in mind. The first: offering some behind-the-scenes help to Nikki’s law firm as they
take on the all-powerful Andover Pharmaceuticals. Andover’s anti-leukemia drug causes terrible side effects
in young patients, but a class-action suit seems doomed to fail. BOLO Consultants have a prescription to
cure that. Meanwhile, Virginia’s lieutenant governor has a sideline as a slum landlord, and his impoverished
tenants are suffering. Tyler Sandford believes his status puts him above the law. But when the Sisterhood and
their allies decide to get involved, no one is beyond the reach of true justice…

“The storyline is like a grand roller-coaster ride, with dips and sharp curves…Michaels has outdone
herself.”—RT Book Reviews on Gotcha!

“Delectable…Revenge that’s creatively swift and sweet, Michaels-style.” —Publishers Weekly on Hokus
Pokus
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From reader reviews:

George Oneal:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important for us. The book Double Down (The Men Of The Sisterhood)
seemed to be making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is
very advantages for you. The guide Double Down (The Men Of The Sisterhood) is not only giving you
considerably more new information but also being your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend
your own personal spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship using the book Double
Down (The Men Of The Sisterhood). You never really feel lose out for everything should you read some
books.

Terry Kline:

The publication with title Double Down (The Men Of The Sisterhood) includes a lot of information that you
can understand it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This particular book exist new
knowledge the information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world now. That is
important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you within new era of
the globalization. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Emma Patterson:

The book untitled Double Down (The Men Of The Sisterhood) contain a lot of information on the item. The
writer explains the woman idea with easy way. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do
not worry, you can easy to read this. The book was written by famous author. The author brings you in the
new period of time of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can continue reading your
smart phone, or program, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-
book, you can available their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice learn.

Ricky Bodkin:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading through a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It all right you
can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Double Down (The Men Of
The Sisterhood) which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.
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